
23 Bliss Avenue 
Tenafly, NJ 07670 
Phone:  201-567-0450    
Visit our website 
www.smafathers.org 

Mass Schedule 
Sundays 
8:00 am;  10:00 am;  12 noon 
Weekdays & Holy Days 
8:00 am;  9:30 am; 11:45 am 
Christmas & New Year’s Day 
8:00 am; 10:00 am; 12 noon 

Confessions 
Saturdays  4:30 pm to 5:00 pm  

Bereavement & Visit to the Sick 
Contact Fr. Anbu Kumar 
201-567-0450 Ext 204 

Our Lady of Perpetual Help 
Rosary 
Every Wednesday at 11:00 am 

Followed by Mass, Adoration 
and Benediction at 5:30 pm 

The Little Way of St. Therese of 
Lisieux 
2nd Sundays after 12 pm Mass 

Bible Reflection Group 
Thursdays: 7:30 pm in the hall 

Perpetual Mass Association 
Office open Monday-Friday 
from 8:00 am  to 3:00 pm 

S.M.A. Vocation Office 
Theresa Hicks, Lay Associates 
201-496-8394 

Fr. Julien Esse, SMA Priesthood 

201- 894-8611  

 

HOLY FAMILY & CHRISTMAS WEEK 

Masses for the week of Dec. 31-JAN. 6 

Local and Provincial superior: 

Fr. Michael Moran, SMA.           

If you invite one of our priests 

out to  perform a sacramental  

function please make sure he is 

informed. 201-567-0450 x 218 

Date Time Intention Requested by: 

Sun.-Sat. 8:00 Liv & Dec Benefactors of SMA   

Sun. Dec. 31 10:00 Special Int. Neill, Forgrave Families   

  12:00 Dec. Mem. Pico Family Daughter & Sister 

Mon. Jan. 1 10:00 James McGoldrick+   

  12:00 Muriel Gawlik+   

Tue. Jan. 2 9:30 Agnes Sweeney+ Angela 

  11:45 Agnes Sweeney+ Hellman Family 

Wed. Jan. 3 9:30 John Slattery+ Friend 

  11:45 Laura & Virgil Costa+ Victoria Ann Costa 

Thurs. Jan. 4 9:30 Sr. Ann Hamill (Liv) Catherine 

  11:45 Louis Vierno+   

Fri. Jan. 5 9:30 Agnes Sweeney+ Mary Quinn & Family 

  11:45 Special Int. Neill, Forgrave Families   

Sat. Jan. 6 9:30 Eleanor Curry+ Friend 

  11:45 Special Int. Neill, Forgrave Families   

READINGS 

First Reading Genesis 15:1-6; 
21:1-3  Abraham’s faith meant 
nothing without Sarah. Faith is 
personal but not solitary. 

Second Reading Hebrews 11:8. 
11-12. 17-19   Faith bears fruit 
by merging with the faith of other 
believers.  

Gospel Luke 2:22-40  Love is 
never without sorrow in this 
world. Mary rejoiced in the love 
of her child; but she would also 
know sorrow.  

New Year schedule: 

Sunday Dec. 31:  8:00,  10:00 and 12 noon Mass  and a 10 PM vigil mass for New Year                                                           

Solemnity of Mary Mass (January 1):   8:00, 10:00 and 12 noon Mass. 

Holiday Collections: 

 

 

 

Thank you for your support. 

date amount 

Dec. 23  $       1,512.00  

Dec. 24  $       2,841.00  

Dec. 25  $       3,130.00  

Wishing you all a happy and blessed 2018 



 

MEMORIAL DONATION:  The Altar Bread, Wine and Sanctuary Candle this week, are offered in 

memory of the Abitante and Falotico families by Carmela and Stephen Abitante.    

 

CHRISTMAS FLOWERS IN MEMORY OF: BY 

CORAZON CASTILLO JOSEFINA MARTINEZ 

PAULINE SCHWEITZER   

JOHN JOE, ANASTASIA WALSH AND FAMILY   

THOMAS, MARGARET MALLON AND FAMILY   

ALL SOULS IN PURGATORY   

THE ROONEY FAMILY EVELYN ROONEY 

  MR. & MRS. JOHN MCNAMARA 

ANNE AND JACK MCNAMARA      AND   

BETTY AND HOWIE ENDERS   

GERARD PATRICK LEE HANNA & JERRY LEE AND FAMILY 

THE LEE, FORAN, AND O'CONNOR FAMILIES HANNA & JERRY LEE AND FAMILY 

FABIO AND MERCEDES RAMIREZ   

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION MR. & MRS. ANDREW SANTULLI 

THE NONACCI FAMILY MR. & MRS.BONACCI 

THE BUONOMO FAMILY FLORENCE BUONOMO 

ALEJANDRO AND MARIA RAMIREZ DE ARELLANO & FAM ROSA FERNANDEZ  

ANTONIO AND ANGELICA FERNANDEZ AND FAM ROSA FERNANDEZ  

JOHN AND ANNIE HAMIL AND FAM ROSA FERNANDEZ  

JEANETTE AND ERNIE CELEMENTE MARIA CUTRO 

ANGELO AND LUCY CUTRO MARIA CUTRO 

ANNIE J MURPHY MICHAEL MURPHY 

HAGGERTY, JAEGER AND RADE…FAMILIES KATHLEEN JAEGER 

DECEASED MEMBERS OF ZAGORDA+COLOMBO FAMILIES   

RAMON AND ROSARIO AMBULO ROSEANNE AMBULO 

HEALTH OF SR. CARMEN ROSE,  PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

MARY FRONZETTI PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

TERRY MYERS PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

SR. MAJORIE MYERS SSND PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

ALL THE  ILL SISTERS AND PRIESTS PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

IN THANKSGIVING FOR FOR MY GRANDSONS' SAFETY PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

  PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

THE FIREMEN IN CALIFORNIA PATRICIA LEFEVERE 

MARY AND AL PRUZINSKY   

ROBERT MURPHY SUSAN MURPHY 

RICHARD AND LENA AVERSO LAWRENCE FLEMING 

PATRICK AND IRENE FLEMING LAWRENCE FLEMING 

EDNA OTTER LAWRENCE FLEMING 

MARIANA MCCARTHY LAWRENCE FLEMING 

ZENAIDA BAUFOLONE, ROSA RABAREZ, DOMINADOR   

JEREMIAS ZAPATA AND EUGENIA IBERA   

DECEASED MEMBERS OF THE KNIGHTS OF COLUMBUS, ST   

PEC & JIM DEBERNARDO   

PLEASE  

NOTE: 

Thank you to 

all who con-

tributed to 

the decora-

tions, deco-

rating and 

those who 

provided 

something for 

the gathering 

after the 

Christmas eve 

Mass.   

We are hav-

ing a pot luck 

New Years 

celebration 

after the 

10:00 PM 

Mass on Sun-

day.  Come 

and celebrate 

the new year 

here in the 

hall with us. 


